

Oldham & Reece, LLP

**416 Pirkle Ferry Road
Suite K-500
Cumming, GA 30040**

Date	Ref. No.
8/8/2006	1380

Larry C. Oldham
4250 High Gables East
Cumming, Georgia 30041

High Gables HOA

Statement of Services Rendered

Date	Atty	Description	Hrs	Rate	Amt
6/3/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Linda Ebert regarding settlement documents and confirmation of voting	0.4	200.00	80.00
6/3/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Peter York regarding production of documents confirming settlement	0.4	200.00	80.00
6/15/2006	LCO...	Telephone conference with Peter York regarding settlement issues	0.4	200.00	80.00
6/23/2006	LCO...	Review correspondence from Peter York regarding settlement issues	0.2	200.00	40.00
6/24/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Peter York regarding provision of settlement confirmation back-up documents	0.8	200.00	160.00
6/26/2006	BSR...	Prepare correspondence to Peter York regarding demand for inspection of corporate records; prepare correspondence to Mr. York regarding settlement terms	0.3	140.00	42.00
6/26/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Peter York regarding information confirming settlement; prepare correspondence to Peter York demanding inspection of corporate records	1.2	200.00	240.00
6/28/2006	LCO...	Telephone conference with Peter York regarding settlement issues	0.8	200.00	160.00
6/29/2006	LCO...	Review correspondence from Peter York regarding settlement confirmation	0.2	200.00	40.00

Total

Payment is due within 15 days of receipt and may be made by check or credit card. Please make checks payable to "Oldham & Reece, LLP" Invoices not paid when due will incur a finance charge of 1.5% per month until paid in full.

Oldham & Reece, LLP

416 Pirkle Ferry Road
Suite K-500
Cumming, GA 30040

Date	Ref. No.
8/8/2006	1380

Larry C. Oldham
4250 High Gables East
Cumming, Georgia 30041

High Gables HOA

Statement of Services Rendered

Date	Atty	Description	Hrs	Rate	Amt
6/30/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Peter York clarifying settlement issues; telephone conference with Peter York confirming settlement terms	0.6	200.00	120.00
7/3/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to individual members of High Gables board of directors	2.7	200.00	540.00
7/5/2006	BSR...	Review letter to individual HOA board members regarding their resignation; revise same	0.4	140.00	56.00
7/5/2006	LCO...	Finalize and send prepare correspondence to individual members of High Gables HOA	1.4	200.00	280.00
7/12/2006	LCO...	Finalize settlement; prepare correspondence to David Weeden confirming mailbox order; prepare correspondence to Peter York regarding settlement confirmation; prepare Mutual Dismissal; telephone conference with Peter York regarding same	1.3	200.00	260.00
7/14/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to High Gables residents regarding special meeting; prepare written consent and proxies to be used at special meeting	3.2	200.00	640.00
7/15/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Jay Pontrelli regarding special meeting and logistics regarding same	1.8	200.00	360.00
7/25/2006	LCO...	Attend High Gables special meeting (no charge)	2.2	0.00	0.00

Total

Payment is due within 15 days of receipt and may be made by check or credit card. Please make checks payable to "Oldham & Reece, LLP" Invoices not paid when due will incur a finance charge of 1.5% per month until paid in full.

Oldham & Reece, LLP

**416 Pirkle Ferry Road
Suite K-500
Cumming, GA 30040**

Date	Ref. No.
8/8/2006	1380

Larry C. Oldham
4250 High Gables East
Cumming, Georgia 30041

High Gables HOA

Statement of Services Rendered

<i>Date</i>	<i>Atty</i>	<i>Description</i>	<i>Hrs</i>	<i>Rate</i>	<i>Amt</i>
7/26/2006	LCO...	Prepare correspondence to Jay Pontrelli regarding end of hostilities and demand for inspection of attorney's fees itemization as part of production of corporate records	0.6	200.00	120.00

Total \$3,298.00

Payment is due within 15 days of receipt and may be made by check or credit card. Please make checks payable to "Oldham & Reece, LLP" Invoices not paid when due will incur a finance charge of 1.5% per month until paid in full.